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2Q19 GDP growth slowed more than expected 

 
  

 
 Friday, July 12, 2019 

 
Highlights: 

 

 2Q19 GDP growth slowed more than expected to near stalling speed at 

0.1% yoy (-3.4% qoq saar) based on flash estimates, with broad-based 

sequential growth weakness seen across all key sectors. This is the slowest 

yoy growth seen since 2Q09 and the worst qoq saar performance since 

3Q12, and marked a sharp retreat from the downwardly revised 1Q growth 

of 1.1% yoy (3.8% qoq saar). While a weaker 2Q growth was already 

discounted, however, this was significantly below the Bloomberg consensus 

forecast of 1.1% yoy (+0.5% qoq saar) as well as our forecast for 1.0% yoy 

(-0.2% qoq saar).  

 

 The main drag was from manufacturing which contracted for the second 

straight quarter by 3.8% yoy (-6.0% qoq saar, marking its third consecutive 

qoq decline), while construction also slowed a tad to 2.2% yoy (-7.6%), 

albeit services was stable at 1.2% yoy (-1.5% qoq saar). Within the 

manufacturing, electronics and precision engineering clusters were the main 

culprits for the underperformance, probably exacerbated by the US-China 

trade impasse in the run-up to the Trump-Xi meeting at G20 in late June and 

coupled with possible kneejerk reactions in the manufacturing supply chain 

activities to the Huawei news. For the construction sector, the growth has 

been supported by an uptick in public construction activities and this is likely 

to sustain in the near-term.  For services, whilst growth was supported 

primarily by finance & insurance, other service industries and ICT, 

nevertheless, the 1.2% yoy growth pace is still a sharp moderation from the 

2.9% yoy seen this time last year. Given the importance of the service sector 

as jobs engine, we’re wary if this could start to impact hiring intentions if 

sentiments remain lacklustre into 2H19, albeit the new DRC measures from 

January 2020 may mitigate any fallout on this front.     

 

 Risk of a technical recession looming ahead? This brought 1H19 GDP 

growth to a paltry 0.6% yoy, which is the weakest first half growth since 

1H09, and clearly heightens the risk of a technical recession if growth 

momentum remains tepid going into the 3Q19. So far, the manufacturing 

and electronics PMIs remains mired in contraction territory, while the Spore 

PMI has also softened quite rapidly in the past two months.  We suspect 

even if there is a US-China trade agreement materialising in the months 

ahead, it may not be sufficient to salvage the domestic manufacturing 

growth for 2H19 (1H19: 1.8% yoy).  
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 Whither policy? This soft 2Q19 flash growth data clearly warrants a closer 

watch on the upcoming October monetary policy meeting where the odds of 

an easing (flatter S$NEER slope or other options?) may have risen.  The 

deterioration in the external macro-environment and the ongoing US-China 

trade war is obviously taking a big dent out of S’pore’s growth prospects 

which explains the migration away from the earlier “slightly below potential” 

story.  A potential downward revision of the official 2019 growth forecast 

from 1.5-2.5% yoy would not come as a surprise, but the question is the 

extent of the downgrade.  With 2Q19 growth coming in significantly weaker 

than expected and 1H19 GDP growth at a paltry 0.6% yoy, the topside of 

our existing forecast range of 0.5-1.5% yoy looks increasingly less likely, so 

a 0%-1% yoy range for full-year 2019 growth may be more realistic at 

this juncture. If a technical recession does materialise, we would also not 

rule out potential targeted stimulus as there is ample fiscal headroom. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Source: Ministry of Trade and Industry (MTI)  
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whole or in part to any other person without our prior written consent. This publication should not be construed as an 
offer or solicitation for the subscription, purchase or sale of the securities/instruments mentioned herein. Any forecast on 
the economy, stock market, bond market and economic trends of the markets provided is not necessarily indicative of the 
future or likely performance of the securities/instruments. Whilst the information contained herein has been compiled 
from sources believed to be reliable and we have taken all reasonable care to ensure that the information contained in 
this publication is not untrue or misleading at the time of publication, we cannot guarantee and we make no 
representation as to its accuracy or completeness, and you should not act on it without first independently verifying its 
contents. The securities/instruments mentioned in this publication may not be suitable for investment by all investors. Any 
opinion or estimate contained in this report is subject to change without notice. We have not given any consideration to 
and we have not made any investigation of the investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs of the 
recipient or any class of persons, and accordingly, no warranty whatsoever is given and no liability whatsoever is 
accepted for any loss arising whether directly or indirectly as a result of the recipient or any class of persons acting on 
such information or opinion or estimate. This publication may cover a wide range of topics and is not intended to be a 
comprehensive study or to provide any recommendation or advice on personal investing or financial planning. 
Accordingly, they should not be relied on or treated as a substitute for specific advice concerning individual situations. 
Please seek advice from a financial adviser regarding the suitability of any investment product taking into account your 
specific investment objectives, financial situation or particular needs before you make a commitment to purchase the 
investment product. OCBC Bank, its related companies, their respective directors and/or employees (collectively 
“Related Persons”) may or might have in the future interests in the investment products or the issuers mentioned herein. 
Such interests include effecting transactions in such investment products, and providing broking, investment banking and 
other financial services to such issuers. OCBC Bank and its Related Persons may also be related to, and receive fees 
from, providers of such investment products. 

This report is intended for your sole use and information. By accepting this report, you agree that you shall not share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver a copy of or otherwise disclose in any way all or any part of this report or any information 
contained herein (such report, part thereof and information, “Relevant Materials”) to any person or entity (including, 
without limitation, any overseas office, affiliate, parent entity, subsidiary entity or related entity) (any such person or 
entity, a “Relevant Entity”) in breach of any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar. In particular, you agree not to share, 
communicate, distribute, deliver or otherwise disclose any Relevant Materials to any Relevant Entity that is subject to the 
Markets in Financial Instruments Directive (2014/65/EU) (“MiFID”) and the EU’s Markets in Financial Instruments 
Regulation (600/2014) (“MiFIR”) (together referred to as “MiFID II”), or any part thereof, as implemented in any 
jurisdiction. No member of the OCBC Group shall be liable or responsible for the compliance by you or any Relevant 
Entity with any law, rule, regulation, guidance or similar (including, without limitation, MiFID II, as implemented in any 
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